
MATRIX SHEET - REVISED

HEARING AID SERVICES AND DEVICES

BD12-00094

TERM: JULY 18, 2013 THROUGH March 31, 2016

Honda Hearing  American Correctional Solutions, Inc. Gibson Hearing

Phone: (800) 395-6094 Phone: (877) 524-5362 Phone: (855) 522-6337 

Fax: (831) 659-5730 Fax: (714) 644-8227 Fax: (530) 878-2291

12-00669 12-00659 - TERMINATED  12-00670

Micro Small Large

Contract # 12-00669 Contract # 12-00659 Contract # 12-00670Basis of Award $584.00 $862.96 No Bid

Rank 1 2

Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 $620.00

Rank 2 1

Basis of Award $584.00 $862.96 No Bid

Rank 1 2

Basis of Award $584.00 $862.96 No Bid

Rank 1 2

Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 No Bid

Rank 1

Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 $620.00

Rank 2 1

Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 $620.00

Rank 2 1

Basis of Award $584.00 $862.96 No Bid

Rank 1 2

Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 $620.00

Rank 2 1

Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 No Bid

Rank 1

Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 $620.00

Rank 2 1

Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 No Bid

Rank 1

Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 No Bid

Rank 1

Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 No Bid

Rank 1

Basis of Award $584.00 $862.96 No Bid

Rank 1 2

SVSP

$891.33

$891.33

$891.33

$891.33

$891.33

$891.33

$891.33

Institution

Basis of 

Award 

Cap

$891.33

$891.33

$891.33

CMC

$891.33

$891.33

$891.33

Basis of 

Award Rate 

and Rank 

Number

$891.33

MCSP

SQ

LAC

CCWF

ASP $891.33

CCC

CCI

KVSP

CTF

PVSP

PBSP

NCYCC

HDSP

NKSP

$891.33
Basis of Award $584.00 $862.96 No Bid

Rank 1 2
SVSP $891.33

Revised 3/16/2015



MATRIX SHEET - REVISED

HEARING AID SERVICES AND DEVICES

BD12-00094

TERM: JULY 18, 2013 THROUGH March 31, 2016

Honda Hearing  American Correctional Solutions, Inc. Gibson Hearing

Phone: (800) 395-6094 Phone: (877) 524-5362 Phone: (855) 522-6337 

Fax: (831) 659-5730 Fax: (714) 644-8227 Fax: (530) 878-2291

12-00669 12-00659 - TERMINATED  12-00670

Micro Small Large

Contract # 12-00669 Contract # 12-00659 Contract # 12-00670

Institution

Basis of 

Award 

Cap

Basis of 

Award Rate 

and Rank 

Number

ASP $891.33ASP $891.33
Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 $620.00

Rank 2 1

Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 $620.00

Rank 2 1

Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 No Bid

Rank 1

Basis of Award No Bid $862.96 No Bid

Rank 1

VNT $891.33

WSP $891.33

SCC $891.33

VSP $891.33

Revised 3/16/2015


